Attachment #2: Ms. Cooper’s e-mail to Mzr. Cooper with Geparation Agreement
Attached

Erom: Cooper Nancy ’ )
Gent: Fri 4[18/2008 8:56 AM

To: Brad Coope

subject: FW: Cooper~ draft agreement

------ Forwarded Message

From: Alice Stubbs ’
Date: Tue, 15 Apr 2008 17 02231 0400

To:

Ce: Steve Mansber

Subject: Cooper- Jdraft agreement

Nancy»

Attached please find a draft agreement- There are & purnber of blanks
that need 10 pe filled in, including the amount of alimony and the
amount of a1y distributive award you may receive. 1know we had
discussed $50,000, but coutdn't yemember if you wanted that to come off
the top OF after all debts were paid. As you can 5¢& we have the debts
being paid and you recetving the remaining proceeds. Let's tatk
tomorrow afternoct if you ate available. Thanks.

Alice
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